
Legal disclaimer 

The website https://hu.nosiboo.eu (hereinafter referred to as: website) operator and the 
owner of the above domain name is ATTRACT Kft. (hereinafter referred to as: Provider) 
(seat: H-7622 Pécs, Siklósi út 1/1, tax number: 11777364-2-02, company registration 
number: 02-09-066227, represented by Walter Streitmann, managing director and Zsolt 
Mátrabérci, managing director). 

Please read the following terms carefully before using this website. By using the website, all 
users implicitly accept the terms and conditions of use set out below. 

1. Copyright 

Unless another copyright owner is named, the copyright of the content of the website, that 
is texts, images, audio and video files, data, other information and the visualisation and 
arrangement thereof, belongs to the Provider. The entire content of the website is the 
intellectual property of the Provider in accordance with the provisions of Act LXXVI of 1999 
on Copyright. 

Any use of the contents of the website, in whole or in part, in particular reproduction, 
transfer, distribution, adaptation or storage of any kind, without the prior written consent of 
the Provider is prohibited, unless otherwise agreed. The exception to this prohibition is for 
personal use, provided that the source (https://hu.nosiboo.eu) is clearly indicated. 

Even under the free use provisions, use is permitted or free of charge only to the extent that 
it is not prejudicial to the normal use of the work and does not unreasonably impair the 
legitimate interests of the author, and provided that it is fair and does not pursue a purpose 
incompatible with free use. 

The content of the website may not be used for commercial purposes without the prior 
written consent of the Provider. 

The use of the content of the website in a manner different from the above provisions or 
exceeding the extent of free use results in unauthorized use, which allows the Provider to 
apply the remedies provided by law. 

The link leading to the website may be placed by anyone on their websites. The intellectual 
works of third parties published on the website may be used only in accordance with the 
provisions of the Copyright Act. Any use that exceeds these limits requires the consent of the 
author. 

2. Responsibility 

The use of the website for any purpose is at each user’s own risk and discretion. The use of 
information downloaded and accessed through this website is voluntary and at your own 
risk. 
The information and data displayed on the website are for informational purposes only, the 
Provider is not responsible for their completeness and accuracy, but makes every effort to 
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ensure that the content shared is accurate at the time of uploading and useful in relation to 
the topic of the website. 

Technical inaccuracies and spelling errors may occur on the website. The Provider reserves 
the right to modify or amend the content of the website at any time without giving any 
reason and without notice. 

The Provider also reserves the right to change the content of the website, in whole or in 
part, or to restrict or terminate its availability at any time. The Provider shall not be liable for 
any damages resulting from temporary gaps on the website, possible malfunctions, system 
errors, business decisions based on the information contained on the website or other 
similar causes. 

The Provider shall not be liable for any loss or damage of any kind arising from access to, or 
failure to access, or use of the website or any information contained therein. 

3. References 

Unless otherwise indicated, the references/links to other websites displayed on the website 
are not owned or operated by the Provider. In consideration of this, the Provider is not 
responsible for the information displayed on external websites. 

4. Data protection 

During the use of the website, regarding the protection of personal data, the Provider shall 
fully comply with the provisions of Regulation (EU) 2016/679 of the European Parliament 
and of the Council of 27 April 2016 on the protection of natural persons with regard to the 
processing of personal data and on the free movement of such data, with the General Data 
Protection Regulation (hereinafter referred to as “GDPR”) repealing Directive 95/46/EC, and 
with Act CXII of 2011 on the right to informational self-determination and freedom of 
information. 

The Privacy Policy of the Provider is available at: https://en.nosiboo.eu/privacy-policy/   

5. Social media 

The Provider has an own Facebook account, where posts are published. Information 
contained therein are only for informative purposes, the use of such data and information is 
the exclusive responsibility of the user. The Provider does not assume any responsibility for 
the content of posts and comments made by users on the Facebook profile. The Provider 
nonetheless reserves the right to delete inappropriate, immoral, offensive or other similar 
content, and to block the contributor from its Facebook profile. 

6. Legal disputes 

The Provider shall aim to settle any disputes arising in connection with this website 
amicably. In the event of any dispute, the Hungarian courts shall have jurisdiction and 
Hungarian law shall prevail. Any use of the website that deviates from or violates the terms 
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and conditions of the Provider as detailed above may result in copyright, civil and criminal 
penalties. 

The Provider will take action against any infringement of which it becomes aware. 

7. Changing the legal disclaimer 

The Provider reserves the right to review the content of the statements published on the 
website and to modify or update them as necessary. Any changes made during these 
reviews are binding on you, so please review the content of the statements from time to 
time to keep track of any changes that may have been made. 

8. Contact information 

If you have any questions about the statements on this website, please contact us using the 
contact information listed in the Imprint. 

Pécs, 07 October 2021 
 

https://en.nosiboo.eu/imprint/
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